
There are many bene ts to building an
ergonomic of ce, and ensuring thateverything
from the chairs to the desks and computers
are the right con guration and size to keep
backs from tightening and necks from
becoming stiff. In fact, studies have shown
that integrating ergonomics intotheworkplace
reduces workers’ time off, lowers health care
costs, improves productivity, results in fewer
workers’ compensation claims, and leads to
happier employees. With so many proven
bene ts, shouldn’ t integrating ergonomics be
an objective for your organization? The cost
to create an ergonomic work environment is
quickly recover ed from the many savings it
provides.

No of ce environment is too big or too small
for the ergonomic professionals at Simcoe
Of ce Products to tackle. From self-employed
people who work out of their home to large
corporations with hundreds of employees,
paying attention to of ce ergonomics will
enhance any sized business.

At Simcoe Of ce Products, they will
review the current of ce con guration and
recommend ergonomic adjustments that
can improve the health and well-being of
employees. From shifting a keyboar d tray
and adjusting the height of a chair, to turning
a computer monitor and lowering the arms

on a kitchen stool. There is a lot that goes
into good ergonomics, and Simcoe Of ce
Products and Design is available to help.
The company steers their clients to better
ergonomics and employee health, and helps
customers spend their money wisely.

Businesses and organizations that could
bene t from an ergonomic assessment
should reach out and contact Simcoe Of ce
Products and Design in Simcoe County ,
Ontario. They are the preferred company
for any and all of ce supply and furniture
needs. To learn more about Simcoe Of ce
Products and the ways in which they help
their customers, please give the company
a telephone call at 705-721-1988, or check
them out online.

There is no better of ce supply company in the Simcoe area or surrounding region.
To learn more about Simcoe Of ce Pr oducts and the ways in which they help their customers succeed,

please give the company a call at 705-721-1988, or check them out online atwww .simcoeof cepr oducts.com.

Investing in ergonomics is a wise business decision
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